-------- Original message --------

From: Jessica Barnes -

Date: 11/8/23 9:57 PM (GMT-06:00)

To: Brent Porfilio <b.porfilio@homerhighway.com>
Subject: FOIA Stykemain Chevrolet

Good evening,

I would like to FOIA the foilowing:
Check # 1187 to Stykemain Chevrolet
Amount $ 132,375.00

Date : 06/20/2023

Include what was purchased

Include why it was purchased

Thank you,
Jessica Barnes



